B001779 Aerophysics Research Center Construction Materials

B001779

L. Miller & Son Inc

Cope Plastics Inc

Piedmont Plastics

Manzi Metals Inc

Price increases

11% after 7/31/08

item | ea
1 |12 Polyethylene Rod $1,447.42 $1,052.16 $1,395.67 no bid
. Natural high density $17,369.04 $12,625.92 $16,748.04
. 12 inch diameter x 78 inch length Price after 7/31/08:
$1052.16 x 11% = $1167.90ea
$1167.90 x 12 = $14,014.80
item | ea
2 | 6 |Steel Plate $1,020.67 no bid no bid $1,560.00
. A36 $6,124.02 $9,360.00
. Hot rolled
. 48 inch x 96 inch x 1 inch
item | ea
3 | 2 |Aluminum $1,950.00 no bid no bid $2,043.00
. Heat temperature grade: 7075 — T651 $3,900.00 $4,086.00
. Cold finished round
. 6 inch diameter x 144 inch length
Total $27,393.06 $12,625.92 $16,748.04 $13,446.00
after 7/31/08 $14,014.80
Business classification
FOB
Estimated delivery item 1=4 weeks 8 weeks 4 weeks 14-16 days ARO
item 2= 1-2 days
item 3=3-5 days
Terms N30 N30
Reference number 34227 B001779
Warranty n/a n/a
Price increases 11% after
Quotation effective until 8/14/08 7/31/08

BID AWARDED PER LINE ITEM TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.
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