FALL 2008 BUS - ATHLETICS

(B001782)
B001782 Spirit Coach Camelot Anchor Tours Kelton Tours Adventure Bus
Noted holding tanks in
Women's Soccer: bathroom
Item# Dates Destination Total Total Total Total Total
1 9/4-9/7/08 Boca Raton, FL $4,730.00 $5,825.00 $6,680.34 $5,375.50 $5,680.00
2 9/12/2008 Dahlonega, GA $1,650.00 $1,810.00 $1,927.33 $1,242.00 $1,345.00
3 9/19/2008 Columbus, GA $1,785.00 $1,975.00 $2,457.70 $1,680.00 $1,473.00
4 9/21/2008 Columbus, GA $1,585.00 $1,975.00 $2,457.70 $1,680.00 $1,373.00
5 10/5/2008 Atlanta, GA $1,250.00 $1,427.00 $1,843.55 $1,314.00 $1,181.00
6 10/16-10/17/08 Pensacola, FL $3,100.00 $2,570.25 $2,768.19 $2,118.00 $1,650.00
7 10/19/2008 Montevallo, AL $761.00 $1,050.00 $1,221.10 $828.00 $980.00
8 10/29/2008 Memphis, TN $1,150.00 $1,625.00 $1,994.07 $1,296.00 $1,270.00
Cross Country:
ltem# Dates Destination Total Total Total Total Total
9 9/13-9/14/08 Memphis, TN $1,250.00 $1,825.00 $1,994.07 $1,496.00 $1,870.00
10 10/3-10/4/08 Louisville, KY $3,400.00\ $2,350.00 $2,282.55 $1,914.00 $2,200.00
11 10/9-10/12/08 Orlando, FL $3,540.00 $5,170.00 $5,205.89\ $4,246.00 $4,745.00
12 10/17-10/18/08 Oxford, AL $1,850.00\ $1,050.00 $1,037.21 $1,649.00 $1,875.00
13 11/7-11/8/08 Searcy, AR $1,995.00 $2,620.00 $2,532.47 $2,114.00 $5,750.00
Men's Soccer:
ltem# Dates Destination Total Total Total Total Total
Winter Park, Lakeland, $6070.00 $5750.00
14 9/4-9/9/08 FL (sleeper) NO BID NO BID rejected NO BID rejected
Winter Park, Lakeland,
15 9/4-9/9/08 FL $4,140.00 $4,925.00 $6,070.00 $5,144.00 $5,250.00
10/16-10/17/08 Pensacola, FL (sleeper) $2768.19 $2300.00
16 NO BID NO BID rejected NO BID rejected
17 10/17-10/18/08 Pensacola, FL $3,100.00 $2,750.00 $2,768.19 $2,418.00 $2,100.00
18 10/29/08 Memphis, TN $1,150.00 $1,625.00 $1,994.07 $1,712.00 $1,270.00
TOURNAMENT
19 11/7-11/9/08 Pensacola, FL to return 11/8 $2030.00 to return 11/8 $2525.00| toreturn 11/8 $2768.00 NO BID| toreturn 11/8 $2300.00
TOURNAMENT
19 11/7-11/9/08 Pensacola, FL to return 11/9 $2230.00 to return 11/9 $2950.00| toreturn 11/9  $2835.00 NO BID| to return 11/9 $3450.00
Business classification BD
FOB
Estimated delivery
Terms N30 N15 N15
Reference number
Warranty
Quotation effective until 9/1/2008 8/8/2008

*xxxxAnchor Tours and Adventure Bus are offering a 55 passenger bus in place of the sleepers, but are rejected due to not meeting specifications
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'BID AWARDED PER LINE ITEM TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. \
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