
Bid B001839

Computer 
Intelligence 
Association

En Pointe 
Technologies 

Sales Inc
Academic 

Superstore
See note item 10

item ea
1 200 Microsoft Office Professional Plus 2007-License          $46.99 $62.77 $65.30

Mfg. Part #79P-00360 $9,398.00 $12,554.30 $13,060.00

2 50 Microsoft Office Standard 2007-License               $38.25 $48.24 $49.68
Mfg. Part #021-07859 $1,912.50 $2,411.88 $2,484.00

3 1 Microsoft Windows Server Standard 2003 R2 SP2-Media Kit $18.90 $20.35 $27.00
Mfg. Part #P73-02703

4 1 Microsft Windows Server 2003 Enterprise-Media Kit $18.90 $20.35 $27.00
Mfg. Part #P72-01780

5 9 Microsoft Windows Server 2008 Standard-License         $74.20 $94.15 $96.95
Mfg. Part #P73-04145 $667.80 $847.37 $872.55

6 5 Microsoft Windows Server Standard 2008-Media Kit         $18.90 $20.35 $27.00
Mfg. Part #P73-03830 $94.50 $101.76 $135.00

7 1 Microsoft Windows Server 2008 Enterprise-License $244.20 $305.78 $314.91
Mfg. Part #P72-03147

8 1 Microsoft Windows Server Enterprise 2008-Media Kit    $18.90 $20.35 $27.00p $ $ $
Mfg. Part #P72-02841

9 1 Microsoft SQL Server 2008 Standard-License               $152.90 $194.04 $201.87
Mfg. Part #228-08667

10 5 Microsoft SQL Server-Software Assurance       $15.80 $17.58 $18.83
Mfg. Part #359-01024 $79.00 $87.92 $94.15

Pricing reflects CLP 
level 1 pricing

11 1 Microsoft SQL Server Standard 2008-Media Kit     $17.50 $20.35 $27.00
Mfg. Part #228-08442

12 5 Adobe Creative Suite 4 Web Standard-License          $196.50 $270.69 $279.88
Mfg. Part #65008622ES $982.50 $1,353.45 $1,119.52

13 2 Adobe Creative Suite 4 Web Standard-Media               $17.50 $18.32 $22.95
Mfg. Part #65009679DE $35.00 $36.64 $45.90

14 10 Adobe Dreamweaver CS4- (v.10) – License      $98.90 $135.35 $139.63
Mfg. Part #65013268ES $989.00 $1,353.50 $1,396.30

15 2 Adobe Dreamweaver CS4- (v.10) – Media         $17.50 $18.32 $22.95
Mfg. Part #65013922DE $35.00 $36.64 $45.90

16 5 Adobe Creative Suite 4 Web Premium-License            $271.25 $371.44 $383.40
Mfg. Part #65017970ES $1,356.25 $1,857.19 $1,917.00
Mac

17 1 Adobe Creative Suite 4 Web Premium-Media             $17.50 $18.32 $22.95
Mfg. Part #65016537DE
Mac

18 1 Adobe Creative Suite 4 Web Premium-License        $271.25 $371.44 $22.95
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Mfg. Part #65017406ES
Win

19 1 Adobe Creative Suite 4 Web Premium-Media                     $17.50 $18.32 $22.95
Mfg. Part #65017366DE
Win

20 5 Adobe InDesign CS4 – (v.6) – License                          $98.90 $135.35 $139.63
Mfg. Part #65025209ES $494.50 $676.75 $698.15

21 1 Adobe InDesign CS4 – (v.6) – Media          $17.50 $18.32 $22.95
Mfg. Part #65024976DE
Win

22 1 Adobe InDesign CS4 – (v.6) – Media                        $17.50 $135.35 $22.95
Mfg. Part #65024590DE
Mac

23 5 Adobe Photoshop CS4 Extended – (v.11) - License  $146.50 $18.32 $209.45
Mfg. Part #65015280ES $732.50 $91.61 $1,047.25

24 1 Adobe Photoshop CS4 Extended – (v.11) – Media           $17.50 $203.53 $22.95
Mfg. Part #65015015DEg
Win

25 1 Adobe Photoshop CS4 Extended – (v.11) – Media           $17.50 $18.32 $22.95
Mfg. Part #65015015DE
Mac

Total $17,624.10 $22,773.83 $23,678.20

Business classification WB
FOB

Estimated delivery 5 days ARO 7 days ARO 5 days ARO

Terms N30 N30 Net
Reference number 4510053

Warranty Manuf Manuf
Quote effective until 2/16/2009 N30 days 1/31/2009

BID AWARDED TO COMPUTER INTELLIGENCE ASSOCIATION AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEETIN



Dell Marketing
Microsoft no longer provides
media. Its available for 
download via Microsoft web

$64.42
$12,884.00

$49.48
$2,474.00

No Bid

No Bid

$96.60
$869.40

No Bid

$313.82

No Bid

$199.05

$18.04
$90.20

No Bid

$278.36
$1,391.80

$18.63
$37.26

$139.75
$1,397.50

$18.63
$37.26

$382.96
$1,914.80

$18.63

$382.96



Dell Marketing
Microsoft no longer provides
media. Its available for 
download via Microsoft web

$18.63

$139.76
$698.80

$18.63

$18.63

$208.98
$1,044.90

$18.63

$18.63

$23,847.52

7-10 days ARO

N30
642255
Manuf

90 days

NG SPECIFICATIONS.



Zones Inc
OM Office 
Supply Inc

CDW Government 
Inc Educational Resources Inc

***All media for open licensing
is now obtained directly from 
Microsoft after the purchase of
open licensing***

$64.06 $64.00 $65.20 $64.88
$12,812.00 $12,800.00 $13,040.00 $12,976.00

$49.23 $49.40 $50.00 $49.86
$2,461.50 $2,470.00 $2,500.00 $2,493.00

$21.04 $24.00 $25.00 ***See note

$21.04 $24.00 $25.00 ***See note

$96.08 $97.00 $98.00 $97.32
864.72 $873.00 $882.00 $875.88

$21.04 $24.00 $25.00 ***See note
$105.20 $120.00 $125.00

$312.05 $315.00 $321.00 $316.09

$21.04 $24.00 $25.00 ***See note$ $ $

$198.03 $199.00 $202.50 $200.58

$17.94 $19.00 $19.00 $18.17
$89.70 $95.00 $95.00 $90.85

$21.04 $24.00 $25.00 ***See note

$281.30 $282.00 $287.00 $304.47
$1,406.50 $1,410.00 $1,435.00 $1,522.35

$18.83 $20.00 $23.00 $25.00
$37.66 $40.00 $46.00 $50.00

$141.17 $142.00 $144.00 $152.80
$1,411.70 $1,420.00 $1,440.00 $1,528.00

$18.83 $20.00 $23.00 $25.00
$37.66 $40.00 $46.00 $50.00

$386.93 $388.00 $399.00 $418.78
$1,934.65 $1,940.00 $1,995.00 $2,093.90

$18.83 $20.00 $23.00 $25.00

$386.93 $388.00 $399.00 $418.78



Zones Inc
OM Office 
Supply Inc

CDW Government 
Inc Educational Resources Inc

***All media for open licensing
is now obtained directly from 
Microsoft after the purchase of
open licensing***

$18.83 $20.00 $23.00 $25.00

$141.17 $139.00 $145.00 $152.80
$705.85 $695.00 $725.00 $764.00

$18.83 $20.00 $23.00 $25.00

$18.83 $20.00 $23.41 $25.00

$211.24 $210.00 $218.00 $228.63
$1,056.20 $1,050.00 $1,090.00 $1,143.15

$18.83 $20.00 $23.00 $25.00

$18.83 $20.00 $23.00 $25.00

$24,017.49 $24,071.00 $24,579.91 $24,672.58

7-14 days ARO 10 days ARO Microsoft: 5-7 bus days ARO
Adobe: 7-10 bus days ARO

N30 N30 N30 N30
S1333668 MPW4574 26843

n/a Softwares Software Manuf Manuf
1/16/2009 90 days 30 days ARO 9/30/2009
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