
 (Alternate TVs) Makertek Video Supply

$ total

Valiant IMC (Alternates)

$ each $ total $ each $ total

Valiant Products Corporation

$ each $ total

 Note: Alternate TV - Philips, 
Model 32PFL5403D provided by 
Dell did not meet requirements. 

 Note: Item 1 quoted as LG 
Commercial, Model 32LC50CB w/RJP-
110F 

tination
s

 days
‐
‐
‐

Net 30 days
1024

2 Years Parts/Labor‐entation

‐
UAH Destination
30 ‐ 45 days ARO

 Y 

‐
UAH Destination

3/12/2009

 N 

1/31/2009

Net 30 days
119956

‐

q

 Note: Item 2 was quoted as Peerless 
Model ST632, alternate wallmount 
does not meet the tilting requirement 
as requested. 

 Note: This bid is with the 
understanding this a tax 
exempt account. 

3/1/2009

 Y 

Philips - Five Star Service

‐
UAH Destination

Beville Center TVs
(B001843)

Advanced Audio of Alabama Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc Central Camera Company Dell Marketing, LP

Ite
Num

m 
ber Description $ each $ tota $l  each $ total $ each $ total $ each

1 TV, Philips 32" Commercial Flat LCD
Plus, MPEG4, Model 32HFL5860D (

 HD wi
77 each)

th SmartCard, Pro:Idiom No Bid No Bid  $    753.00  $            57,981.00 No Bid No Bid $      547.02   $           42,120.54 No Bid No Bid  $                  975.84  $        75,139.68  $   754.00  $        58,058.00 

2 Smartmount Tilt Wall-Mount for 23" -
Peerless ST640 (77 each)

 46" Flat Panel TVs Black Finish, No Bid No Bid  $      69.50  $              5,351.50 No Bid No Bid $      62.86     $             4,840.22 No Bid No Bid  $                    29.97  $          2,307.69  $     62.53  $          4,814.81 

3 Clone Programmer, Philips Model 22
for fast cloning (1 each) Note: Item N

AV
ot Awar

1135, Wire
ded, No

less, Smar
t Needed.

tLoader No Bid No Bid  $      35.00  $                   35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Charge No Charge 112.00$    112.00$             

Bid Bond (Y/N)  N  Y  N  Y 
Total No Bid Total  $            63,367.50 Total No Bid Total  $           46,960.76 Total No Bid Total  $        77,447.37 Total  $        62,984.81 

Business classification ‐ ‐ ‐ ‐
FOB UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Des
Estimated delivery ‐ 30 ‐ 45 days ARO ‐ 14 - 30 day
Terms ‐ Net 30 days ‐ Net 30
Reference number ‐ ‐ ‐ 467382668
Warranty ‐ 2 years ‐ Per OEM docum
Quotation effective until ‐ 3/25/2009 ‐ 2/9/2009
Notes:Notes:

BID AWARDED BY LINE ITEM TO LOWEST, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEETING BID SPECIFICATIONS


	Sheet1

