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Handheld Scanning Terminal

Item Qty
1 1 Scanning Terminal:  PDCT-E Super-rugged WM5.0 handheld; No bid No Bid

Intermec Technologies 128/128N1.

Includes:

128/128NI, A/STD, A.Img, 802a/F, WM5.0, 256SD 3088.54 2690.00 2895.00 2333.25

Secure Digital Card (256MB, RoHS) 44.88 43.00 45.00 38.90

Spare CK61 Battery - RoHS compliant 109.47 100.00 115.24 95.00

Single Slot USB Cradle 249.65 234.00 366.00 216.00

Universal Power Supply (12 VDC, 50W, FW5012, PB42, RoHS) 85.12 79.00 89.65 73.45
for the CN30A (replaces Part No. 851-082-001)

Cable, USB-A to USB-B, 2 meter RoHS (Use with Single Dock for ActiveSync 34.88 33.00 36.00 30.25
connection to PC USB port)

CK61 Manual 10.27 40.00 36.00 No Charge

AC Power Cord, US RoHS 7.19 6.50 7.51 6.05

Replacement Kit (CK60 Tethered Stylus, Blue, CK61A) 27.87 26.50 29.50 24.25
$3,657.87 $3,252.00 No Bid $3,619.90 $2,817.15 No Bid

Business classification SB SD SB WB
FOB UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination

Estimated delivery 2 weeks ARO 4-5 Days 4-6 Weeks 2-3 Days
Terms Not Noted N30 N30 N30

Reference number Not Noted U050901 B001879 CM-051509-005
Warranty Not Noted 90 Days/Mfg. 1 Year 1 Year

Quotation effective until Not Noted 6/23/2009 60 Days 9/30/2009
doesn't meet specs doesn't meet specs doesn't meet specs
for Intermec Tech "G" for Intermec Tech "G" for Intermec Tech "G"
Model. Cannot supply "G" Model. Cannot supply "G" Model. Cannot supply "G"

BID AWARDED TO BARCODING, INC. AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER W/ THE BEST DELIVERY MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.  
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