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Base price see note below
Quantity 72,000
40 interior pages w/4 page cover $14,940.00 $21,525.00 $12,729.17 $12,650.00 $13,877.54 $20,104.00 No Bid

32 interior pages w/4 page cover $13,279.00 $17,886.00 $10,515.12 $10,822.00 $12,439.10 $16,935.00 No Bid

Base price
Per 1,000 mail handling $24/m $1,940.00 $14/1,000 $18/m $14.50 $80/m No Bid

40 pages: Addition of 4 page body increments $1,082.00 $2,326.00 $1,000.00 $711.00 $861.08 $3,134.00 No Bid
40 pages: Subtraction of 4 page body increments $578.00 $2,326.00 $200.00 $330.00

32 pages: Addition of 4 page body increments $1,082.00 $2,326.00 $1,000.00 $711.00 $861.08 $3,134.00 No Bid
32 pages: Subtraction of 4 page body increments $578.00 $2,326.00 $200.00 $330.00

Additional charge for bleeds $0.00 NO N/C N/C  see below N/C see below N/C No Bid

Additional charge for varnish $0.00 $300.00 $250.00 Included on cover $12.50/1,000 $598.00 No Bid

40 pages: Addition of 1,000 copy increments $136.00 $163.00 $163.00 $175.69 129.05 (32+cover) $226.00 No Bid
40 pages: Subtraction of 1,000 copy increments

32 pages: Additional of 1,000 copy increments $136.00 $163.00 $136.00 $150.79 129.05 (32+cover) $226.00 No Bid
32 pages: Subtraction of 1,000 copy increments

Additional charge for half tones $0.00 NO N/C $10.00 N/C $2.00 No Bid

Shipping/freight charges for delivery to UAH $1,248.00 $775.00 $1,600.00 (40)  $1,240.00 Included in base $734.00 No Bid
(32)  $970.00

40 interior pages plus shipping $16,188.00 $22,300.00 $14,329.17 $13,890.00 $13,877.54 $20,838.00 No Bid
32 interior pages plus shipping $14,527.00 $18,661.00 $12,115.12 $11,792.00 $12,439.10 $17,669.00 No Bid

Print size 8.125 x 10.675 40lb offset instead
Bid awarded to Action Printing as the lowest responsible bidder meeting specs. 8 3/8 x 10 5/8" Full Bleed of 35lb newsprint
The print size of Mignone does not meet specs and would require a re-design. Author's alterations Customer press

$90/hr check $300/day
Business classification LB
Estimated delivery 10-12 wkg dys 15 wrkg dys 2 1/2 wks 15 wrkg dys per specifications 7 wrkg days
Terms N30 N30 N30 N30 N30 N30
Reference number N/A 77443-BG PB 91791 #84795
Warranty N/A 5 wrkg dys
Quotation effective until 60 days 16-Apr-10 Mar-10 31-Jul-09 5/1/2010 50 days



Quantity 72,000

Walsworth Publishing 
Co., Inc.

Ambrose Printing 
Company

FALL 2009 32 page interior $13,279.00 $17,886.00
Mail handling (55,000 pcs) $1,320.00 $1,940.00
Add 4 page increment $1,082.00 $2,326.00
Bleeds $0.00 $0.00
Varnish $0.00 $300.00
Additional 8,000 copies $1,088.00 $1,304.00
Half‐tones $0.00 $0.00
Shipping $1,248.00 $775.00
Additional notes
TOTAL $18,017.00 $24,531.00

WIN/SPR 10 40 page interior $14,940.00 $21,525.00
Mail handling (55,000 pcs) $1,320.00 $1,940.00
Bleeds $0.00 $0.00
Varnish $0.00 $300.00
Additional 8,000 copies $1,088.00 $1,304.00
Half‐tones $0.00 $0.00
Shipping $1,248.00 $775.00
Additional Notes
TOTAL $18,596.00 $25,844.00

SUMMER 10 32 page interior $13,279.00 $17,886.00
Mail handling (55,000 pcs)g ( , p ) $1,320.00$ , $1,940.00$ ,
Bleeds $0.00 $0.00
Varnish $0.00 $300.00
Additional 8,000 copies $1,088.00 $1,304.00
Half‐tones $0.00 $0.00
Shipping $1,248.00 $775.00
Additional notes
TOTAL $16,935.00 $22,205.00

TOTAL $53,548.00 $72,580.00
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$10,515.12 $10,822.00 $12,439.10 $16,935.00 No Bid
$770.00 $990.00 $797.50 $4,400.00 No Bid

$1,000.00 $711.00 $861.08 $3,134.00 No Bid
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

$250.00 $0.00 $900.00 $900.00 No Bid
$1,088.00 $1,206.32 $1,032.40 $1,808.00 No Bid

$0.00 $200.00 $0.00 $40.00 No Bid
$1,600.00 $970.00 $0.00 $734.00 No Bid

$90.00 $300.00
$15,223.12 $14,989.32 $16,330.08 $27,951.00 No Bid

$12,729.17 $12,650.00 $13,877.54 $20,104.00 No Bid
$770.00 $990.00 $797.50 $4,400.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
$250.00 $0.00 $900.00 $900.00 No Bid

$1,304.00 $1,405.52 $1,032.40 $1,808.00 No Bid
$0.00 $200.00 $0.00 $40.00 No Bid

$1,600.00 $1,240.00 $0.00 $734.00 No Bid
$90.00 $300.00

$16,653.17 $16,575.52 $16,907.44 $27,986.00 No Bid

$10,515.12 $10,822.00 $12,439.10 $16,935.00 No Bid
$770.00$ $990.00$ $797.50$ $4,400.00$ , No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
$250.00 $0.00 $900.00 $900.00 No Bid

$1,088.00 $1,206.32 $1,032.40 $1,808.00 No Bid
$0.00 $200.00 $0.00 $40.00 No Bid

$1,600.00 $970.00 $0.00 $734.00 No Bid
$90.00 $300.00

$14,223.12 $14,278.32 $15,469.00 $24,817.00 No Bid

$46,099.41 $45,843.16 $48,706.52 $80,754.00 No Bid
Print size  8.125 x 10.675 40lb offset instead
8 3/8 x 10 5/8" Full Bleed of 35lb newsprint

Author's alterations Customer press
$90/hr check $300/day

Action Printing
Mignone 

Communications, 
Inc.

Signature Offset Interstate Printing
Alabama 

Web 
Press



NOTE: Catalogs are 
designed to be 8 1/4 x 
10 3/4. This printer 
cannot meet this 
requirement and will 
result in a redesign of 
our catalog.

NOTE: Catalogs are 
designed to be 8 
1/4 x 10 3/4. This 
printer cannot meet 
this requirement 
and will result in a 
redesign of our 
catalog.
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