PANASAS STORAGE CLUSTER SYSYTEM (B001885)

ltem Product Number Product Description Vendor uom Aspen Sysytem, Inc Dell Marketing Global GovEd Penguin Computing Line Item Low Bid |Line Item Low Vendor
1 PAS7-1SW1-20TB-5GC-1+10 PANASAS ACTIVESTOR7 SHELF 20TB PANASAS 1EA | S 23,873.12 | $ 23,600.29 No Bid S 27,752.50 | $ 23,600.29 Dell Marketing
2 SVCSPAREDB100 DIRECTOR BLADE 100 PANASAS | 1EA | $ 7,258.06 | $ 7,174.98 No Bid S 5,062.50 | $ 5,062.50 | Penguin Computing
3 SVCSPARESW16 16-PORT GIGABIT ETHERNET SWITCH BLADE PANASAS | 1EA | S 10,752.69 | $  10,629.58 No Bid S 3,750.00 | $ 3,750.00 | Penguin Computing
4 Shipping fees (if not included in items 1 - 3) S 207.00 | $ - No Bid S 450.00
Total Low Bid Total Low Vendor
S 42,090.87 | $ 41,40485]  NoBid | 37,015.00 | $ 37,015.00 | Penguin Computing
Y N N Y Bid Bond Y/N
4 wks ARO - No Bid 12-15 days ARO Delivery
Net 30 Net 30 No Bid Net 30 Terms
3Yr Per OEM No Bid 3Yr Warranty
Notes

BID AWARDED BY TOTAL LOW TO LOWEST, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER.

DELL MARKETING DID NOT SUBMIT CERTIFIED OR CASHIER CHECK OR BID BOND PER BID SPECIFICATIONS
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