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McAfee Software License Renewal (B001892)

Item Product Description Vendor Inno
 Beyond 
vation, Inc  Business Services  CDW-G  Dell Ma

LP
rketing, 
 

 D
C

G Technolog
onsulting, LL

y 
C 

 D
Educati

iskovery 
onal Systems 

 En Pointe 
Technologies 

Multiwave Ed and Gov 
Department  OM Office Supply Inc  PC Mall Gov Inc  SDF Professional 

Computer, Inc   Line Item Low Bid Line Item Low Vendor

1 TOTAL PROTECTION FOR ENDPOINT LICENSE RENEWAL MCAFEE 15,882.6$          0 27,$          780.00 $      15,740           .00 15$       ,380.00 $     15,90            0.00 $         15,400.00     15,040.00$           No Bid 15,450.00$                15,200.00$           27,100.00$              15,040.00$                  En Pointe Technologies
2 VIRUSSCAN STUDENT USE OPTION LICENSE MCAFEE 1,055.7$            5 1,$            725.00 $      1,050             .00 1$         ,025.00 $     1,05              0.00 $         1,075.00       1,025.00$             No Bid 1,040.00$                  1,025.00$             1,050.00$                1,025.00$                    Dell Marketing, LP
3 VIRUSSCAN CONSUMER HOME USE OPTION LICENSE MCAFEE 101.9$               7 $               129.00 $      100                .00 98.00$              9$                        6.00 $         108.00          98.00$                  No Bid 100.00$                     98.00$                  100.00$                   96.00$                         DG Technology Consulting, LLC
4 VIRUSSCAN FOR MAC LICENSE MCAFEE 249.2$               6 $               299.00 $      245                .00 $            241.00 $     24                 2.00 $         240.00          236.00$                No Bid 250.00$                     238.00$                244.00$                   236.00$                       En Pointe Technologies
5 VIRUSSCAN FOR MAC STUDENT USE OPTION LICENSE MCAFEE 42.2$                 3 $                 69.00 $      50                 .00 $           41.00   $     4                   0.00 $         43.00            41.00$                  No Bid 45.00$                       41.00$                  42.00$                     40.00$                         DG Technology Consulting, LLC

 Total Low Bid Total Low Vendor
$       17,331.8   1 30,$          002.00 $      17,185           .00 16$       ,785.00 $      17,32           8.00 $         16,866.00     16,440.00$           No Bid 16,885.00$                16,602.00$           28,536.00$              16,440.00$                  En Pointe Technologies

 Total Low Bid Total Low Vendor
OPTIONAL RENEWAL PERCENTAGE INCREASE- 1ST YEAR 0% 0% SEE NOTE SEE NOTE 2% No Bid 5% No Bid 4% N/A 10% 0% Beyond Innovation, Inc
OPTIONAL RENEWAL PERCENTAGE INCREASE- 2ND YEAR 0% 0% SEE NOTE SEE NOTE 2% No Bid 5% No Bid 4% N/A 10% 0% Beyond Innovation, Inc

SB, SD, WB, WD LB WB SB, WB LB Business 
Classification(s)

NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA Bid Bond Y/N or NA
UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination U esAH D tination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination FOB Point

None Net10 Net 30 Net 30 - Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Terms

Not Provided 1 Year Standard  1 Y
Tec

ear McAf d 
hnical Supp

ee Gol
ort 

1 Year No Warranty  As
McAf

 implied by 
ee licensing 

NA Software, Licenses N/A 1 Year Warranty

5 Business Days 15-20 ARO 2 - 5 Business Days a7 - 10 D ys ARO ? within 14 Days ARO 7 Days 10 Days ARO  3 Business Days 
ARO 

7 -10 Days ARO Delivery

BI-MCAFEE-306 PGR4117 969,259.00$      NA B001892 Your Reference No.

9/8/2009 30 Days  30 Days after opening 9/9/2009 10/1/2009 8/15/2009 30 Days 30 Days 8/10/2009 8/7/2009 Quotation Effective

Notes:  ARO: After-
Receiving-Order 
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